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From: Eric Evans

Sent: Monday, March 22, 2021 10:43 AM

To: ‘Darren Lee'

Subject: RE: Dallas Head Quarry App.

Darren,

I'am concerned that your application does not contain sufficient information in regards to Malheur County Code 6-6-8-4.
The application is pretty sparse on information in this section. But, it does have an answer in each of those sections, and
I will deem it complete. Honestly, | am concerned the planning commission might deny it based on not having enough
information. You will have to wait 6 months before you can reapply pursuant to County Code. But, if that is your desire,

then let’s do it.
Thanks,

Eric Evans, REHS

Planning Director

Malheur County Planning & Zoning
251 B Street W #12

Vale, OR 97918

541-473-5185 — phone
541-473-5140 — fax

From: Darren Lee <clown924@hotmail.com>
Sent: Monday, March 22, 2021 5:47 AM

To: Eric Evans <Eric.Evans@malheurco.org>
Subject: Re: Dallas Head Quarry App.

Do you have everything you need to put me on for April?
Thanks,
Darren Lee

From: Eric Evans <Eric.Evans@malheurco.org>
Sent: Monday, March 15, 2021 4:04 PM

To: Darren Lee <clown924@hotmail.com>
Subject: RE: Dallas Head Quarry App.

Mr. Lee,

My office has to deem your application complete on March 23™ in order to meet the deadline for the April 22" meeting.

Thanks,

Eric Evans, REHS
Planning Director
Malheur County Planning & Zoning
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Vale, OR 97918
541-473-5185 — phone
541-473-5140 —fax

From: Darren Lee <clown924@hotmail.com>
Sent: Monday, March 15,2021 9:11 AM

To: Eric Evans <Eric.Evans@malheurco.org>
Subject: Dallas Head Quarry App.

Update.
I dug the test holes onsite last week and am awaiting a result on the estimated gravel quantity analysis

required for goal5. I also submitted a check for $500.00 for the application. | will submit the remaining
required documents as soon as they arrive. When is the next P and Z meeting | can getin on?

Thanks,
Darren Lee



